



**WARREN CONSOLIDATED SCHOOLS**  
**Asbestos Abatement Bid Tabulation – Unit Prices**

January 16, 2019

CONTRACTOR	MOBILIZATION	PIPE-FIT/MASTIC/CARPET/DOOR/ 4' X 7' FRAME/7' X 7' FRAME/PARTITION WALL CAULK TACKBOARD SCRAPE PODS/TACKBOARD GRIND PODS ADD
QUALITY ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES	\$400	\$22.00/\$1.85/\$1.45/\$.90/\$80.00/\$300.00/\$385.00/\$10.00/\$9.00/\$10.00
QUALIFIED ABATEMENT SERVICES	\$500	\$30.00/\$3.00/\$3.50/\$2.00/\$150.00/\$480.00/\$650.00/\$100.00/\$10.00/\$15.00
ENVIRONMENTAL MAINTENANCE ENGINEERS	\$300	\$30.00/\$2.00/\$3.50/\$1.00/\$150.00/\$300.00/\$500.00/\$8.00/\$10.00/\$20.00
TOTAL ENVIRONMENTAL	\$850	\$27.00/\$2.50/\$4.50/\$1.50/\$350.00/\$350.00/\$550.00/\$12.00/\$6.00/\$9.00
TRUST THERMAL ABATEMENT	\$650	\$30.00/\$2.00/\$2.00/\$1.00/\$125.00/\$400.00/\$850.00/\$12.00/\$10.00/\$20.00
BDS ENVIRONMENTAL	\$500	\$25.00/\$2.00/\$2.00/\$.50/\$75.00/\$100.00/\$125.00/\$15.00/\$5.00/\$7.00
METROPOLITAN ENVIRONMENTAL	NO BID	NO BID
GLOBAL GREEN SERVICE GROUP	NO BID	NO BID
GREAT LAKES ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICE INC.	\$350	\$12.00/\$.95/\$3.25/\$.95/\$125.00/\$125.00/\$275.00 (EXT 400.00)/\$3.00/\$2.00/\$5.00
MWV	\$350	\$15.00/\$4.00/\$4.00/\$3.00/\$75.00/\$175.00/\$175.00/\$5.00/\$5.00/\$7.00

**WARREN CONSOLIDATED SCHOOLS**

**Asbestos Abatement Bid Tabulation – T & M Prices**

January 16, 2019

CONTRACTOR	T & M M - F	T & M SATURDAY	T & M SUNDAY & HOLIDAY
QUALITY ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES	\$95/HR	\$120/HR	\$135/HR
QUALIFIED ABATEMENT SERVICES	\$80/HR	\$96/HR	\$112/HR
ENVIRONMENTAL MAINTENANCE ENGINEERS	\$70/HR	\$85/HR	\$110/HR
TOTAL ENVIRONMENTAL	\$70/HR	\$90/HR	\$110/HR
TRUST THERMAL ABATEMENT	\$105/HR	\$155/HR	\$205/HR
BDS ENVIRONMENTAL	\$75/HR	\$90/HR	\$95/HR
METROPOLITAN ENVIRONMENTAL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
GLOBAL GREEN SERVICE GROUP	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
GREAT LAKES ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICE INC.	\$55/HR	\$82.50/HR	\$110/HR
MWV	\$55/HR	\$65/HR	\$75/HR